
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 15-6024

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for 

FOR: Concrete Aggregates (Bulk Material)

TIME & (Date of Award through May 31, 2016)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., May 8, 2015
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

GROUP 1 (Load Bulk Bins at SAWS Location; Vendor Delivery)  

18,000 TN PRICE

Concrete Sand PER TON 24.80  36.80

1. Eastside Service Center 3930 E. Houston St.), SAWS #1408 TOTAL 446,400.00 NO BID 662,400.00

2,000 TN PRICE

Concrete Sand PER TON 26.20  36.80

2. Northeast Reclamation Site (12536 O'Connor Rd.), SAWS # 42034 TOTAL 52,400.00 NO BID 73,600.00

1,000 TN PRICE

Concrete Sand PER TON 24.80  36.80

3. Rilling Road Site (1718 Rilling Road), SAWS #45522 TOTAL 24,800.00 NO BID 36,800.00

1,000 TN PRICE

Concrete Sand PER TON 25.27  36.80

4. Northside Operations center (15103 Capitol Port), SAWS #45523 TOTAL 25,270.00 NO BID 36,800.00

500 TN PRICE

Concrete Sand PER TON 22.48  36.80

5. Medio Creek WRC (2231 Hunt Lane), SAWS #45524 TOTAL 11,240.00 NO BID 18,400.00

500 TN PRICE

Concrete Sand PER TON 22.48  36.80

6. Aqua Pura Site (6725 Aqua Pura), SAWS #45525 TOTAL 11,240.00 NO BID 18,400.00

500 TN PRICE

Concrete Sand PER TON 23.39  36.80

7. Northwest Service Center (6003 Wurzbach Rd.), SAWS #45526 TOTAL 11,695.00 NO BID 18,400.00

500 TN PRICE

Concrete Sand PER TON 25.58  36.80

8. Dos Rios WRC (3495 Valley Rd.), SAWS #45527 TOTAL 12,790.00 NO BID 18,400.00

*

 

TOTAL (GROUP 1) TOTAL 595,835.00 NO BID 883,200.00

GROUP 2 (Load Bulk Bins at SAWS Location; Vendor Delivery)

1,500 TN PRICE

Washed Limestone (3/4") PER TON 19.99 18.50 22.34

1. Eastside Service Center (3930 E. Houston St.), SAWS #4957 TOTAL 29,985.00 27,750.00 33,510.00

1,000 TN PRICE

Washed Limestone (3/4") PER TON 21.39 17.00 22.34

2. Northeast Reclamation Site (12536 O'Connor Rd.), SAWS #42035 TOTAL 21,390.00 17,000.00 22,340.00

500 TN PRICE

Washed Limestone (3/4") PER TON 17.66 20.00 22.34

3. Medio Creek WRC (2241 Hunt Lane), SAWS #45528 TOTAL 8,830.00 10,000.00 11,170.00

*

TOTAL (GROUP 2) TOTAL 60,205.00 54,750.00 67,020.00

EXTENSION 1 595,835.00 54,750.00

EXTENSION 2 595,835.00 54,750.00

EXTENSION 3 595,835.00 54,750.00

EXTENSION 4 595,835.00 54,750.00
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Net Net Net

Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days

 

Delivery Days 1 days

*LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:  

 

Alamo Cement Co. Demandstar  

Capitol Aggregates SAWS Website

Cemex

Keller Material, Ltd.  

 Martin Marietta

Statewide Materials Transport
Texstar Enterprises, Inc.

Vulcan Construction Materials, LP

2


